COLUMBIA PUBLIC SCHOOL DISTRICT

Bid Result
BID NO: C-25017
SUBJECT: Pizza Program
DATE: 4/17/2024
SCHOOL/DEPT: Nutrition Services
AWARDED TO: Smart Mouth Pizza

. Smart Mouth Pizza Pizza Hut
Individual Items Atlanta, GA Columbia, MO

Individual Items Unit Price with Upcharge Unit Price with Upcharge
7" Frozen Pizza Crust 0.82800
Slized Pepperoni for pizza 0.05300
Pizza Topping -italian Sausage 0.17200

No bid
Pizza Sauce, crushed tomatoes 0.38000
6" Pizza Boxes 0.51200
IQF LMPS Low Sodium Mozzarella Cheese Shred 0.27200
Pizza Type Middle School Recipe Cost per Pizza Cost per Pizza
Pepperoni $1.7000 $3.5000
Cheese $1.6500 $3.5000
Italian Sausage $1.8200 $3.5000
Cheese Calzone (using bag) $1.6500 No bid
Pepperoni Calzone (using bag) $1.7000 No bid
Pizza Type High School Recipe Cost per Pizza Cost per Pizza
Pepperoni 1.7900 3.5000
Cheese 1.7400 3.5000
Italian Sausage 1.8200 3.5000
Combo 1.7900 4.5000
Cheese Calzone (using bag) 1.7400 No bid
Pepperoni Calzone (using bag) 1.7900 No bid
Equipment Cost STD UpCharge Cost STD UpCharge
Merchandiser hat for hatco 600.00
6ft pizza cabinet only 3,200.00
Hatco 3-tier smart mouth warmer 5,400.00
Turbo Chef Conveyor Oven 17,120.00
Large Capacity TurboChef Conveyor Oven 19,260.00 No bid
Cart 1,230.00
Cart for double 1,130.00
Stacking kit 160.00
Rolling Pan Rack w/o pans 850.00




